
 
FRONTIER ALLOY STEELS LIMITED 
 CORPORATE SOCIAL RESPONSIBILITY INITIATIVES  

 

“Frontier Alloy Steels Limited” considers the social and environmental aspects of any business 
idea in addition to the economic aspects. Frontier has been a part of the CSR Initiative of our 
Government    since   2015.  The very first step taken by us towards CSR was donating a sum of 
Rs. 15 Lakh to the Prime Minister’s National Relief fund keeping in mind the massive 
widespread help it would do at the times of Contingencies. 
 
Corporate social responsibility is no longer defined as charity, but by its overall involvement in 
activities that improve the quality of people’s lives. Subsequently, we realized that our niche for 
innovation would do betterment in the Society. Consequently in the year 2017, Frontier Alloy 
joined hands with the IIT-Kanpur for promotion of Technology Research and 
Development. We provided IIT-Kanpur with a sum of Rs. 38 Lakh towards development of 
CSR project for two consecutive years that is for 2017 and 2018  
 
Our collaboration with IIT-Kanpur resulted in development of a Non-Electric Water Filter. 
Drinking Water is the basic necessity for every individual, but taking a view at the enormous 
water pollution, all the citizens are not blessed with the clean drinking water. Thus we installed a 
Water plant in Ajgain, Unnao District which is today providing the villagers with good quality 
drinking water which is free from all the viruses, pathogens and bacteria’s with zero electricity 
consumption and minimal wastage of water.  
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Education is another critical factor that should be considered in the designing the corporate social 
responsibility programs. Basic education is widespread, but opportunities for learning continue 
to elude many. Thus under the guidance of our founder Shri Kundan Lal Bhatia Ji, The Company 
has also adopted a School in the labour Colony in Shastri Nagar area of Kanpur named as Shakti 
Seva Dal Inter College. We contributed a sum of Rs. 2 Lakh towards development of the School 
 
The School is being revamped under our initiatives as CSR. The main intention behind adopting 
the school was to provide our future generation with a conducive environment to study and grow. 
We are continually striving to ensure that more number of out-reach children can have the 
privilege and the opportunity to study. 
 

 
 
Further the Company is planning to channelize to the CSR activities towards Skill Development. 
Our aim is to empower the students with skills with which they could enter into the real world 
and start making a living immediately after passing the senior secondary examinations. This 
project will be given shape under the vision of our founder Shri Kundan Lal Bhatia ji. The 
Company strives to make every possible attempt to benefit the society as a whole. 
 

 
 
 


